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As Princess of Wonderland Palace and the future Queen of Hearts, Dinah's days are an endless monotony of
tea, tarts, and a stream of vicious humiliations at the hands of her father, the King of Hearts. The only
highlight of her days is visiting Wardley, her childhood best friend, the future Knave of Hearts--and the love
of her life. When an enchanting stranger arrives at the Palace, Dinah watches as everything she's ever wanted
threatens to crumble. As her coronation date approaches, a series of suspicious and bloody events suggests
that something sinister stirs in the whimsical halls of Wonderland. It's up to Dinah to unravel the mysteries
that lurk both inside and under the Palace before she loses her own head to a clever and faceless foe. Part
epic fantasy, part twisted fairy tale, this dazzling saga will have readers shivering as Dinah's furious nature
sweeps Wonderland up in the maelstrom of her wrath. Familiar characters such as Cheshire, the White
Rabbit, and the Mad Hatter make their appearance, enchanting readers with this new, dark take on Alice's
Adventures in Wonderland. But be warned...not every fairytale has a happy ending. This is the story of a
princess who became a villain.
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From reader reviews:

Herman Lewis:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge to make
these people keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will probably
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know which you should start with. This Queen of Hearts is our recommendation to help
you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Adam Rucks:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the concept Queen of Hearts
suitable to you? The particular book was written by well known writer in this era. The particular book
untitled Queen of Heartsis the main one of several books this everyone read now. This kind of book was
inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new way of measuring that
you ever know previous to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, consequently all of people can
easily to be aware of the core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information about this
world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Betty Sanchez:

Typically the book Queen of Hearts has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research
before write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the point easily after looking over this book.

Daniel Cadena:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So
you know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading
is very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by book. Many kinds
of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is this Queen of Hearts.
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