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The conversations between Igor Stravinsky and Robert Craft are unique in musical history.' Sunday Times
The contents of the celebrated series of Conversations, dating from the last fifteen years of Stravinsky's life,
were taken down by Robert Craft in informal talks with the composer. Craft lived for twenty-one years with
the Stravinskys in their Hollywood home, or nearby, and for two more years in a next-door hotel room in
New York. In the early 1950s he accompanied the composer on his concert tours, and from the mid-1950s to
the end of Stravinsky's life co-conducted his concerts. Memories and Commentaries, the second of the series,
is a brilliant portrait gallery in which Stravinsky, prompted by Craft, sets down with characteristic wit and
insight his memories of such famous writers and musicians as Romain Rolland, Reynaldo Hahn, Lord
Berners and Manuel de Falla. There are long sections devoted to Diaghilev, to Russian composers, to
Stravinsky's childhood and youth in Russia, and detailed accounts of his collaboration with Benois (The
Nightingale), Gide (Persephone) and Auden (The Rake's Progress). The Conversations books are the only
published writings attributed to Stravinsky that are actually by him, in the sense of fidelity to the substance
of his thoughts, making them required reading for all students and lovers of Stravinsky.
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From reader reviews:

Cynthia Sharma:

The book Memories and Commentaries give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You need to
use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Memories and
Commentaries to get your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase
your knowledge about several or all subjects. You may know everything if you like open and read a
publication Memories and Commentaries. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or
encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this publication?

Barbara Jackson:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster.
And you have extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to answer
that question simply because just their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each
person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this specific Memories and
Commentaries to read.

John Pierre:

The book untitled Memories and Commentaries contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains
your girlfriend idea with easy approach. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was written by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can keep reading
your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the
e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Margaret Thompson:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This publication Memories and Commentaries was filled about science. Spend
your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has various feel
when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can experience
enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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