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Building on the success of Jan Horrox's previous book, Introduction to Making Cloth Dolls, Jan's new book
focuses on her exquisite fantasy dolls, including beautiful fairies, amazing mermaids, an enigmatic witch and
a steampunk doll with attitude. These magical dolls are full of character and are amazingly easy to achieve
with the help of this practical book. Step-by-step instructions are provided for all the basic techniques,
including how to make the bodies, heads, arms, legs, hands and feet; how to make the hair; and how to
needlesculpt and paint the exquisite faces to really bring your character to life. There are instructions for
making webbed fingers, delicate fairy wings as well as a mermaid's tail, and there are three easy-to-follow
projects to put all your newly acquired skills into practice. Jan encourages the reader to use their imagination
and create dolls of their own, and the alternative designs that accompany each project show how easily this
can be done simply by changing the faces, colours, fabrics and embellishments used.
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From reader reviews:

James Cansler:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book.
They are really reading whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the
person who don't like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem
as well as exercise. Well, probably you should have this Making Fantasy Cloth Dolls.

Johnathan Fuller:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of various ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Making Fantasy Cloth Dolls, you can tells your family, friends and also soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Amanda Stone:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This publication Making Fantasy Cloth Dolls was filled about science. Spend your extra time
to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a
new book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern
era like now, many ways to get book you wanted.

Irma Lovern:

A number of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt that
when they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the particular book Making Fantasy Cloth Dolls to
make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is developing when you including
reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about
book and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside
that the book Making Fantasy Cloth Dolls can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse using
what must you're doing of this time.
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